


TEN IN DANGER AS 
ICE HOLDS 2 BOATS 

–––––  
Lake Mail Craft Trapped 
and C.G. Crew Is Caught 

Attempting Rescue. 
–––––  

LELAND. Mich., March 24 (AP) 
– A mail boat with four men aboard 
and a coast guard boat with a crew 
of six were held fast in the ice four 
miles off North Manitou Island to-
night after an all-day effort to break 
loose. 

Fears were expressed here for the 
safety of the ten men, who were 
without food or fuel. Heavy blocks 
of ice were moving slowly about the 
craft. The greatest danger was that a 
wind would come up, crushing the 
small boats between cakes of ice. 

The mail boat left North Manitou 
Island this morning for Leland in 
command of Capt. Tracy Grosvenor 
who carried as passengers Eli 
Firestone, manager of a Manitou 
orchard; Chris Neilson, Norfolk, 
Mich., and a man named Peterson 
from Ludington, Mich. 

Breaks a Shaft. 
In attempting to get through the 

ice the 30-foot mail boat broke a 
shaft. 

A coast guard crew in a 40-foot 
power boat under Capt. Fisher put 
out from South Manitou Island but 
the craft was caught alongside the 
mail boat. 

Late this afternoon the fishing tug 
Helen S., started from here, but was 
unable to reach the stranded boats. 
Helen S. started from here, but was 
her way back. 

The Wabash car ferry Ann Arbor 
was expected to arrive here at 7 a.m. 
tomorrow to attempt a rescue. 

 (transcript) 
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